
 

 

Keys of the Kingdom 
 

 
Jesus said, “I will give unto you the keys of the kingdom of heaven: and whatsoever thou shalt bind on earth shall 
be bound in heaven: and whatsoever thou shalt loose on earth shall be loosed in heaven” not “the keys to the 
kingdom.” (Matthew 16:19)  
 
Sometimes people think they have the keys to the kingdom. No, we have the keys of the kingdom. The kingdom of 
God is within us; we are in it now. Now there is a great difference in the keys TO the kingdom and the keys OF the 
kingdom.  
 
If someone gave you the keys to a large hotel, it would get you into the main hall, but you probably couldn’t get 
into one room in that hotel. If you have the keys of the hotel you can get into every room.  
 
Jesus said, “But rather seek ye the kingdom of God: and all these things shall be added unto you. Fear not, little 
flock; for it is your father’s good pleasure to give you the kingdom.” (Luke 12:31-32) The literal Greek says the 
Father took great delight in giving you the kingdom. So we are in the kingdom of God today and the kingdom of 
God is within us. “... The kingdom of God cometh not with observation...the kingdom of God is within you.” (Luke 
17:20-21)  
 
God Has Given Us the Kingdom 
We have the keys. We are capable of operating in that kingdom. A key in that day represented knowledge. The 
people that were highly educated in that day, instead of getting a diploma from a school, wore big keys that hung 
on their belt. You could look at a person and see how educated they were. The keys stood for knowledge, and a key 
is something that unlocks. Jesus said, “I give you the keys of the kingdom,” then immediately revealed some 
knowledge of those keys. “Whatever you bind on earth shall be bound in heaven and whatever you loose on earth 
shall be loosed in heaven.” Too many people are waiting for God to move, and praying for God to do something 
about their finances. They’ve been praying for God to do many things that the Bible tells us to do.  
 
In Joshua 1:8 God told Joshua,“This book of the law shall not depart out of thy mouth; but thou shalt meditate 
therein day and night, that thou mayest observe to do according to all that is written therein: for then thou shalt 
make thy way prosperous, and thou shalt have good success.” You notice that it was Joshua that was going to cause 
good success to come his way, if he did what God told him to do. Joshua couldn’t expect to receive the things God 
said he could have if he didn’t do what God told him to do. Neither can we expect to walk in victory if we don’t use 
the keys of the kingdom that God has given us on earth.  
 
One translation reads: “whatever thou has authority to bind on earth is what is already bound in heaven, 
whatsoever thou has authority to loose on earth is what is already loosed in heaven.” Well, that adds some light to 
it. 
 
What is Bound Out of Heaven?  
There is no sickness, no disease, no poverty there. We have the authority to bind that on the earth, and stop it from 
operating on the part we’re walking on. Then what is loosed in heaven? There is health up there, there is 
happiness, there is prosperity. There is no lack there. Thank God we have the authority to loose those things on the 
earth. It must be the will of God for it to be on the earth as it is in heaven. Jesus even taught the disciples to pray 
this way. “Thy will be done in earth as it is in heaven.” (Matthew 6:10) If Jesus said to pray this way, then it has to 
be God’s will. We know Jesus would not ask His disciples to pray something against the will of God.  
  
Some people believe God intended for the earth to fall under satan’s rule. They believe that God intended for the 
earth to be a lower order, but I believe God designed it to operate in the laws of the Spirit world and to be a  
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duplication of the planet that spawned it, and of the spirit world that brought it into existence.  
 
Through the fall of man the earth was brought down to a lower order. When Adam bowed his knee to satan, and 
satan became the god of the world system, then all men came under that system. But Jesus came to destroy, to 
loosen, dissolve and undo the works of the devil. (1 John 3:8b) Jesus took back that authority and delivered it back 
to man. Jesus said I will give you the keys of the kingdom. You can see that is future, but he brought it into the 
present.  
 
Before Jesus ascended into heaven, he was heard to proclaim, “... All power is given unto me in heaven and in 
earth.” (Matthew 28:18) He had it all – all power. Then He turned to the believers and said you go. The 16th 
chapter of Mark records it, “Now you go in my name, you cast out demons, you speak with new tongues, you lay 
hands on the sick and they will recover.” So Jesus returned that authority to the believer. Some think He carried it 
on to heaven with Him, and when we get to heaven we’ll have this power and this authority. Well, what will we do 
with it then? We don’t need it then; we need it now. There will be no enemy in heaven. There will be no sickness 
there, no disease there, no poverty there. We need it now, here in this earth, in this life. Jesus said I give you the 
keys of the kingdom, and one of the keys of the kingdom is “whatever you bind on earth will be bound in heaven.” 
All heaven will stand behind what you bind in Jesus’ name.  
 
How Do You Bind? 
You can bind satan with your words, and you can render him harmless and ineffective against you by using the 
Word of God, by speaking in agreement with what God says.  
 
Paul says, “neither give place to the devil.” (Ephesians) Evidently we can give place to the devil, especially with our 
words. “Thou art snared with the words of thy mouth...” (Proverbs 6:2)  
 
Many are binding their finances by the words of their mouth. They are loosing the ability of satan against their 
home by saying “satan is destroying my home”, or “satan is stealing my finances.” Jesus gave you the power of 
binding and loosing, and you are loosing the wrong thing.  
 
As He stood on the mountain and said, “all power is given unto me in heaven and earth,” He turned immediately to 
the disciples and gave all who believe in His name, the keys of the kingdom. He gave the authority of this earth to 
man, and man became the agent which God uses to bring about His work in the earth. Too many people are still 
waiting for God to move in the earth. They want God to do something about the devil, sickness, and poverty, when 
God has already done all He is going to do about the devil until the end time. He has done it all through Jesus. We 
must act on His words and do the things He said to do. 
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